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This publication is available through the Near North District School Board website or in 
other accessible formats upon request. 
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Message from the Board Chair  and Director  
 

At the Near North District School Board (NNDSB), our mission is to provide 
opportunities that empower all learners to develop their potential by providing diverse 
pathways which lead students to become model citizens who achieve life goals and 
contribute to the betterment of society. In its renewed Multi-Year Accessibility Plan, 
NNDSB seeks to put accessibility at the forefront of this mission.  

In consideration of the previous plan and existing practices, NNDSB recognized that, 
while accessibility has often been considered, it has not been a guiding factor in its 
decision-making processes. When thinking about the goals for accessibility in this 
updated plan, the Accessibility Committee unanimously agreed that it would like 
accessibility to be the standard, not the exception. Rather than have an individual self-
identify with an accessibility need, our goal is to create an environment that makes 
decisions and establishes practices that are accessible by default and incorporate these 
considerations in our daily activities to a point where they become second nature. To 
this effect, NNDSB strives to create a truly accessible environment for everyone. By 
creating such an environment, we hope it inspires the students who learn and grow in 
our schools to become accessibility champions who can inspire positive generational 
change as they become contributing members of our communities.  

While these goals sound ambitious, and we recognize that there will be limitations to 
what can realistically be accomplished, we will endeavour to push ourselves to find 
solutions, drawing on internal and external expertise to accomplish our accessibility 
goals within available resources. 
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Disability Defined  
 

Defining disability is a complex, evolving matter. A disability is a physical, mental or 
neurological condition that limits a person’s movements, senses, or activities. This term 
covers a broad range and degree of conditions. A disability may have been present at 
birth, caused by an accident, or developed over time. 



5 
NNDSB – MULTI-YEAR ACCESSIBILITY PLAN  

Commitment to Accessibility 
 

The Near North District School Board (NNDSB) is committed to fulfilling its 
responsibilities under the Ontario Human Rights Code and under the Accessibility for 
Ontarians with Disabilities Act (AODA), 2005 in a way that ensures equitable access to 
its buildings, programs, services, policies, and resources for all the students, families, 
employees and members of the public who collectively make up the NNDSB 
community.  

NNDSB further commits to achieving its accessibility goals by addressing the right to 
equal opportunity and inclusion for persons with disabilities throughout society by 
identifying, removing, and preventing barriers to access. 

The NNDSB is committed to: 

• addressing any current accessibility barriers and preventing and removing future 
barriers; 

• ensuring, where possible, that Board policies, procedures, and practices are 
consistent with the principles of accessibility and inclusive/universal design;  

• identifying barriers that require more immediate changes to make premises 
accessible; 

• meeting quarterly to discuss the progress in implementing and achieving the 
objectives detailed in the Multi-Year Accessibility Plan; 

• drafting an annual report of accomplishments of the Multi-
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About the Near North District School Board  
 

The Near North District School Board is responsible for the public education of over 
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Accessibility Committee  and  
Developing the 2023-2028  Plan 
 

In February 2023, the NNDSB Accessibility Committee began meeting with the goal of 
reviewing the previous Accessibility Plan and to plan the NNDSB accessibility work for 
the next iteration of the plan. Over the course of the project, the committee welcomed 
guest representatives from various departments as well as external consultants and 
community members.  

The committee consulted the following groups/individuals to provide feedback and input 
regarding the updated Accessibility Plan: Special Education Advisory Committee 
(SEAC), Equity Advisory Circle (EAC), First Nations Advisory Committee (FNAC), 
Indigenous Youth Circle (IYC), Student Senate, School Councils, the Mental Health 
Lead, Federation Partners, Special Education Team and Specialty Teachers. 

These efforts combined with a new group of committee members have resulted in a 
refreshed vision of accessibility and a detailed plan to further improve accessibility for 
the NNDSB and community that it serves.  

The NNDSB Multi-Year Accessibility Plan outlines the steps that will be undertaken to 
identify and remove structural, attitudinal, systemic, and communication barriers to 
access for persons with disabilities. The plan also sets out the steps that the NNDSB 
will take to achieve these goals, how we envision the outcomes of our efforts, and how 
we will measure our progress. 

The Multi-Year Accessibility Plan and updates to the Plan will be posted on the Board’s 
website at www.nearnorthschools.ca/board/accessibility-

http://www.nearnorthschools.ca/board/accessibility-standards-for-customer-service/
http://www.nearnorthschools.ca/board/accessibility-standards-for-customer-service/
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solicits community feedback about its administrative guidelines, thereby providing an 
opportunity to identify operational or systemic barriers, resulting in access to the full 
spectrum of opportunities and outcomes. Stakeholder feedback is gathered through the 
email address 

mailto:accessibility@nearnorthschools.ca
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Physical Environment  
 

From 2013 to 2022, the NNDSB made significant improvements to its facilities, focusing 
primarily on mobility accessibility. Since 2020, barrier free washroom upgrades have 
been completed at 13 schools, bringing the total percentage of barrier free washrooms 
within the schools to 71%. NNDSB has 14 fully accessible schools. 91% of schools 
have barrier free access to the building from parking areas, and 100% of schools have 
designated parking. 86% of schools have barrier free accessible exterior and vestibule 
doors.    

When planning capital projects, Facilities and Capital Planning consider accessibility 
features into their designs wherever possible. While funding for projects can be 
constrained, this approach allows NNDSB to continue to incorporate accessibility 
enhancements into its projects at every opportunity. 

School based staff work closely with Special Education Staff, and staff from Facilities 
and Operations to identify on-site supports to students. This information is maintained 
by the Special Education Department and allows the NNDSB to provide individual 
accommodations to students in a timely manner thus ensuring every student can 
experience an inclusive learning environment at the NNDSB. 

 
Transportation 
 

Nipissing-Parry Sound Student Transportation Services (NPSSTS) is a non-profit 
corporation that supports student transportation across four school boards including 
NNDSB. The Superintendents of Business of each Board sit on the NPSSTS Board of 
Directors, with the Superintended of Business for NNDSB acting as the Board Chair for 
2023-2024. NPSSTS ensures students’ needs are met according to those identified by 
the school. 
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Service Notification of Disruption of 
Service, develop a procedure which 
guides the notification process for 
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